

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110

(617)556-0007

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

STATEMENT NO. 91052

FEBRUARY 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH January 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

1/30/2012	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM SEWER COMMISSION RE: TOWN FARM ROAD SEWER CONNECTION.	0.10	16.50
	SUBTOTAL:	0.10	16.50

TOTAL:	0.10	16.50
--------	------	-------

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:	0.00
--------------	------

TOTAL DUE:	\$ 16.50
-------------------	-----------------

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91051

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

FEBRUARY 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH January 31, 2012

GENERAL LABOR SERVICES

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: QUESTIONS RE:
HIGHWAY SURVEYOR POSITION; REVIEW PRIOR ADVICE TO TOWN RE: SAME AND
CHANGING ELECTED TO APPOINTED POSITION; E-MAIL PRIOR ADVICE TO
SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT; LEGAL RESEARCH TO ADVISE BOARD OF SELECTMEN
RE: ADDITIONAL QUESTIONS.

RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER (BY E-MAIL) TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN
RE: HIGHWAY SURVEYOR.

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM TOWN RE: REQUEST FOR OPINION RE: EMPLOYEE BREAKS.

SUBTOTAL:	6.10	1,006.50
TOTAL:	6.10	1,006.50

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	1,006.50

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91053

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

FEBRUARY 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH January 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

REVIEW REQUEST FOR ADVICE FROM CEMETARY COMMISSION RE: PERPETUAL
CARE FUNDS.

SUBTOTAL:	0.20	33.00
TOTAL:	0.20	33.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	<u>33.00</u>

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91156

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

FEBRUARY 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH January 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

DEBRIS REMOVAL PROJECT - DRAFT LETTER IN RESPONSE TO PUBLIC RECORDS
REQUEST FOR BID INFORMATION; DRAFT E-MAIL MEMORANDUM TO
SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT. RE: CONTENTS OF RESPONSE.

SUBTOTAL:	0.60	99.00
TOTAL:	0.60	99.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	99.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91507

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

MARCH 22, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH February 29, 2012

GENERAL LABOR SERVICES

RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: HIGHWAY
DEPARTMENT EMPLOYEE BREAKS.

REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: OPINION ON
EMPLOYEE BREAKS.

SUBTOTAL:	1.00	165.00
TOTAL:	1.00	165.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	165.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91508

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

MARCH 22, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH February 29, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

2/7/2012	PAC	TOWN FARM ROAD - REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM COMMISSION RE: SEWER CONNECTION.	0.10	16.50
2/21/2012	PAC	TOWN FARM ROAD - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE-CHAIRMAN, SEWER COMMISSION RE: SEWER CONNECTION.	0.10	16.50
2/22/2012	PAC	TOWN FARM ROAD - CONTINUE TO REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM COMMISSION TO EVALUATE WHETHER SEWER CONNECTION PERMIT HAS BEEN ISSUED; ANALYZE FACTS TO ADVISE COMMISSION RE: SAME.	0.70	115.50
2/23/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SEWER COMMISSION SECRETARY RE: CONTRACT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE-CHAIRMAN RE: FACTS; REVIEW SECRETARY OF STATE WEBSITE RE: CORPORATE FILINGS FOR HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS.	0.60	99.00
2/27/2012	PAC	TOWN FARM ROAD - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: SEWER CONNECTION PERMIT; REVIEW PERMIT; EVALUATE NEXT STEPS IN ADVISING COMMISSION RE: PERMIT.	0.70	115.50
2/29/2012	PAC	TOWN FARM ROAD - CONTINUE TO ANALYZE ISSUES RE: SEWER CONNECTION; REVIEW DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS RE: SAME.	0.40	66.00
SUBTOTAL:			2.60	429.00

TOTAL: 2.60 429.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 0.00

TOTAL DUE: \$ 429.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91527

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

MARCH 22, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH February 29, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

PERPETUAL CARE FUND - REVIEW AND ANALYZE BOARD OF CEMETERY COMMISSIONERS' QUESTIONS RE: USE OF PERPETUAL CARE FUNDS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: USE OF PERPETUAL CARE FUNDS; REVIEW PRIOR ADVICE TO TOWN RE: CEMETARY PERPETUAL CARE FUND.

PERPETUAL CARE FUND - CONTINUE TO ANALYZE BOARD OF CEMETERY COMMISSIONERS' QUESTIONS RE: USE OF PERPETUAL CARE FUNDS; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: USE OF PERPETUAL CARE FUNDS; BEGIN TO DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO BOARD OF CEMETARY COMMISSIONERS RE: USE OF PERPETUAL CARE FUNDS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, CEMETARY COMMISSION RE: REQUEST FOR OPINION.

FINALIZE OPINION LETTER TO CEMETARY COMMISSION RE: PERPETUAL CARE FUND.

SUBTOTAL:	5.40	891.00
TOTAL:	5.40	891.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	891.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91538

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

MARCH 22, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES FROM THROUGH February 29, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: POSSIBLE GIFT TO TOWN; RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER (BY E-MAIL) TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: SAME.

KENNEL LICENSE - REVIEW REQUEST FOR OPINION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: KENNEL LICENSE PROCESS AND PROCEDURE; EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: FACTUAL CIRCUMSTANCES FOR DENIAL OF KENNEL LICENSE.

ANALYZE C.140 AND TOWN BYLAWS RE: KENNEL LICENSES TO ADVISE BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: ENFORCEMENT OPTIONS RE: UNLICENSED KENNEL.

TAXATION/SOLAR ENERGY FACILITIES - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM COUNSEL FOR DEVELOPER RE: PROPOSED PILOT AGREEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL RE: PROPOSED REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT; ANALYZE LEGAL AND PRACTICAL ISSUES RAISED BY REVISIONS.

REVIEW MOTIONS FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING 2/9/12; ANALYZE ISSUES RE: MOTION UNDER ARTICLE 8; E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: APPROVAL OF MOTIONS AS TO FORM.

TAXATION/SOLAR ENERGY FACILITIES - ANALYZE DEVELOPER'S PROPOSED CHANGES TO PILOT AGREEMENT AND DRAFT FURTHER REVISIONS; DRAFT E-MAIL MEMORANDUM TO DEVELOPER'S COUNSEL RE: REVISION ISSUES AND EXCHANGE FURTHER E-MAIL COMMUNICATION RE: SAME.

TOWN MEETING - ANALYZE FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: MOTION TO CHANGE ELECTED SUPERINTENDENT OF STREETS TO APPOINTED POSITION.

PLANNING BOARD - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PLANNING BOARD ASSISTANT RE: FACTS AND REQUEST FOR ADVICE RE: CONSULTANT CONTRACT FOR SITE PLAN REVIEW CASE; REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM PLANNING BOARD RE: SAME; RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO PLANNING BOARD RE: CHOICE OF CONSULTANT AND RELATED MATTERS.

CSX - EVALUATE TOWN'S OPTIONS RE: CSX POSITION RE: PAYMENT TO TOWN; DRAFT E-MAIL TO CHAIRMAN, CONSERVATION COMMISSION RE: TOWN'S OPTIONS AND NEXT STEPS IN NEGOTIATING WITH CSX.

TAXATION/SOLAR ENERGY FACILITIES - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER SOUZA RE: VALUATION OF SOLAR ENERGY GENERATING PROJECT; REVIEW DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE IGR RE: SAME; ANALYZE ISSUES TO

ADVISE BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: VALUATION; E-MAIL BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER SOUZA RE: REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.

FIRE TRUCK DONATION - REVIEW ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION FOR BONDSVILLE FIRE ASSOCIATION; REVIEW SECRETARY OF STATE WEBSITE RE: SAME; REVISE GIFT AGREEMENT BASED ON NEW INFORMATION RE: FIRE ASSOCIATION; E-MAIL BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: DONATION AND GIFT AGREEMENT.

TAXATION/SOLAR ENERGY FACILITIES - REVIEW LAW RE: ASSESSMENT OF SOLAR FACILITIES AND LAND UNDER REAL ESTATE AND PERSONAL PROPERTY PROVISIONS OF STATE TAX PROVISIONS; REVIEW BACKGROUND FACTS AND ANALYZE VALUATION FOR PURPOSES OF PILOT AGREEMENT; DRAFT E-MAIL MEMORANDUM TO COUNSEL FOR DEVELOPER RE: FURTHER NEGOTIATION OF TERMS OF PILOT AGREEMENT.

TOWN COMMON IMPROVEMENTS - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RIGHT OF WAY REPRESENTATIVE AT DOT RE: ALTERATION OF ROADS WITHIN TOWN COMMON.

TAXATION/SOLAR ENERGY FACILITIES - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM DEVELOPER'S COUNSEL RE: REVISED PILOT AGREEMENTS; FORWARD AGREEMENTS TO SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT; REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM ASSISTANT RE: FORM OF AGREEMENTS; REVIEW CONSULTANT'S REPORT TO TOWN RE: ASSESSMENT OPTIONS AND COMPARISON OF ASSESSMENT REVENUE V. PILOT REVENUE.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: GIFT AGREEMENT FOR FIRE TRUCK.

TAXATION/SOLAR ENERGY FACILITIES - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN SOUZA RE: PILOT PAYMENTS; REVIEW ASSESSOR'S CONSULTANT REPORT RE: VALUE OF PROPERTY; ANALYZE ISSUES RE: SAME; FOLLOW UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMAN SOUZA RE: PREPARATION FOR MEETING WITH ASSESSORS ON 2/9/12 AND PREPARATION FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING.

TAXATION/SOLAR ENERGY FACILITIES - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR DEVELOPER RE: TERMS OF PILOT.

KENNEL LICENSE - FINALIZE DRAFT AND SEND OPINION LETTER TO SELECTMEN RE: ISSUANCE OF KENNEL LICENSES IN TOWN.

TAXATION/SOLAR ENERGY FACILITIES - EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: CONSULTANT REPORT; EVALUATE TOWN'S OPTIONS RE: REPORT.

PREPARE FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING ON 2/9/12; REVIEW REVISED MOTIONS FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING ON 2/9/12; E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT APPROVING MOTIONS AND NOTING QUANTUM OF VOTE ON MOTIONS.

TAXATION/SOLAR ENERGY FACILITIES - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR DEVELOPER RE: ELIGIBILITY REQUIREMENTS FOR PILOT AGREEMENT; REVIEW BACKGROUND FACTS RE: SAME; REVIEW ISSUES RE: TOWN MEETING CONSIDERATION OF PILOT AGREEMENTS.

TOWN COMMON IMPROVEMENTS - REVIEW PLANS PROVIDED FROM DOT ROW BUREAU RE: POSSIBLE ALTERATION OF ROAD.

REVIEW FACSIMILE FROM FIRE CHIEF RE: HIS REVIEW OF TRANSCRIPT OF HIS DEPOSITION IN THIRD PARTY LITIGATION NOT INVOLVING THE TOWN.

TOWN COMMON IMPROVEMENTS - E-MAIL SLECTMEN'S ASSISSTANT RE: RIGHT OF WAY BUREAU AND ALTERATION OF ROAD LAYOUT.

REVIEW E-MAILS FROM TOWN RE: CSX.

TOWN COMMON IMPROVEMENTS - TRANSMIT E-MAIL FROM RIGHT OF WAY BUREAU RE: ALTERATION OF ROAD.

TOWN COMMON IMPROVEMENTS - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ENGINEER RE: ALTERATION OF ROAD FOR VEHICULAR TRAFFIC AND SIDEWALK AROUND GAZEBO AS REQUESTED BY DOT.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY FOR THIRD PARTY IN LITIGATION NOT INVOLVING TOWN RE: REQUEST TO SPEAK WITH TOWN EMPLOYEE; E-MAIL FIRE CHIEF RE: SAME.

E-MAIL TOWN RE: SPECIAL TOWN MEETING ON 2/9/12.

CSX - REVIEW E-MAILS FROM TOWN RE: GIFT TO TOWN; REVIEW CSX WEBSITE RE: DONATION POLICIES; E-MAIL TOWN RE: CSX POSITION ON GIFT.

EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; REVIEW MINUTES OF MEETING AND VOTES ON ARTICLES.

EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: CONSENT TO REPRESENTATION RE: PROPOSED BRIMFIELD CASINO (NO CHARGE).

TOWN COMMON IMPROVEMENTS - REVIEW PLANS, DOT REQUEST FOR EASEMENT AND OTHER DOCUMENTS RE; ALTERATION OF ROAD LAYOFF; EVALUATE ACTIONS THAT TOWN NEEDS TO TAKE.

TOWN COMMON IMPROVEMENTS - E-MAIL BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: ALTERATION OF ROAD TO INCORPORATE ROADS AND SIDEWALKS INTO ROADS FOR FEDERAL FUNDING PROJECT AT TOWN COMMON.

SUBTOTAL:

23.30

3,811.50

SOUTH STREET SEWER LINE CERTIFICATION

DRAFT LETTER TO USDA AREA SPECIALIST, CONTINUE TO DRAFT CERTIFICATE RE: NO LITIGATION AND ATTORNEY'S FEES PAYMENTS; EXECUTE USDA DOCUMENTS.

TRANSMIT DOCUMENTS TO USDA TO COMPLETE FUNDING PROCESS, INCLUDING LITIGATION CERTIFICATE AND ATTORNEY'S FEES STATEMENT.

SUBTOTAL:

1.30

214.50

TOWN V. WELLER

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT CLERK RE: STATUS OF ORDER; REVIEW ORDER FROM COURT; SEND ORDER TO SHERIFF FOR SERVICE.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PRO SE DEFENDANT RE: HER REQUEST FOR ANOTHER HEARING BEFORE THE BOARD OF SELECTMEN.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: STATUS OF LITIGATION AND WHETHER BOARD OF SELECTMEN WILL ENTERTAIN ANY

FURTHER HEARINGS ON VICIOUS DOG.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PRO SE DEFENDANT AND SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: WHETHER TOWN WILL RECONSIDER ITS DECISION TO EUTHANIZE THE DOG.

EVALUATE NEXT STEPS IN ENFORCEMENT.

REVIEW RETURN OF SERVICE AND FILE WITH THE COURT.

SUBTOTAL:	1.70	280.50
-----------	------	--------

TOTAL:	26.30	4,306.50
--------	-------	----------

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; SHERIFF FEES, REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		137.64
--------------	--	--------

TOTAL DUE:	\$	4,444.14
------------	----	----------

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91884

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

APRIL 26, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH March 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: CASINO AND VARIOUS MATTERS (NO CHARGE).

KENNEL LICENSES - EXCHANGE VOICE MESSAGES WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: REQUEST FOR FURTHER ADVICE.

KENNEL LICENSE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: STATUS OF MATTER AND ADVICE AS TO FURTHER STEPS.

REGIONAL SCHOOL WARRANT ARTICLE - REVIEW DRAFT FROM SCHOOL COMMITTEE; REVIEW PRIOR ADVICE TO TOWN RE: ARTICLE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMAN'S ASSISTANT RE: ARTICLE AND RELATED MATTERS.

REVIEW E-MAIL RE: OPEN MEETING LAW COMPLAINT; REVIEW COMPLAINT; REVIEW OPEN MEETING LAW; BEGIN TO DRAFT RESPONSE TO COMPLAINT; E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL FACTS.

REVIEW REQUEST FOR TOWN COUNSEL LETTER FROM TOWN'S AUDITOR; REVIEW PRIOR CORRESPONDENCE TO AUDITOR AND POSSIBLE CLAIMS AGAINST TOWN; REVIEW STATUS OF MATTERS CITED IN PRIOR CORRESPONDENCE.

PREPARE TOWN COUNSEL LETTER TO TOWN'S AUDITOR.

OPEN MEETING LAW COMPLAINT - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: FACTS; REVIEW POSTED NOTICE OF BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEETING; DRAFT RESPONSE TO OPEN MEETING LAW COMPLAINT.

REVIEW NOTICE FROM REGIONAL SCHOOL DISTRICT RE: WARRANT ARTICLE FOR BUILDING PROJECTS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: WARRANT ARTICLE FOR STREET OPENING BYLAW; REVIEW TOWN'S GENERAL BYLAWS; LEGAL RESEARCH TO PREPARE WARRANT ARTICLE; REVIEW BYLAWS AND REGULATIONS FROM OTHER TOWNS ON SUBJECT.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: OPEN MEETING LAW COMPLAINT.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: REGIONAL SCHOOL DISTRICT WARRANT ARTICLES.

REVIEW FINAL MASSACHUSETTS SCHOOL BUILDING AUTHORITY FORM BALLOT QUESTIONS AND WARRANT ARTICLES; REVIEW 2011 ANNUAL TOWN MEETING ARTICLES AND BALLOT QUESTIONS; DRAFT REGIONAL SCHOOL DISTRICT BALLOT QUESTIONS AND WARRANT ARTICLES.

E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: WARRANT ARTICLES AND BALLOT QUESTIONS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: REGIONAL SCHOOL DISTRICT QUESTIONS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: SEXUAL HARRASSMENT TRAINING; FOLLOW-UP RE: SAME; E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: TRAINING (NO CHARGE).

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: QUESTIONS ON SCHOOL BORROWING ARTICLES AND BALLOT QUESTIONS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: BILLING QUESTION (NO CHARGE).

DRAFT WARRANT ARTICLE AND BYLAW RE: ROAD OPENING; E-MAIL CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: SAME.

REVIEW CONSENT TO REPRESENTATION SIGNED BY BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: CASINO (NO CHARGE).

EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH SELECTMAN'S ASSISTANT RE: SCHEDULING TRAINING (NO CHARGE).

REVIEW DRAFT WARRANT ARTICLE RE: BUILDING INSPECTOR REVOLVING ACCOUNT FEES AND SALARY.

NELSON STREET IMPROVEMENT PROJECT - EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: CONTRACT REVIEW.

NELSON STREET IMPROVEMENT PROJECT - REVIEW CONTRACT DOCUMENTS CONTRACTOR'S PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BONDS AND INSURANCE CERTIFICATES; DRAFT LETTER TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS AND APPROVAL AS TO FORM.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: KENNEL COMPLAINT.

SUBTOTAL:	13.10	2,013.00

FIRE STATION PROJECT

REVIEW STATUS OF FIVE STAR CLAIM AND WHETHER STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS HAS EXPIRED.

SUBTOTAL:	0.20	33.00

TOTAL:	13.30	2,046.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

		75.59
TOTAL COSTS:	-----	

TOTAL DUE:	\$	2,121.59

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91885

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

APRIL 26, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH March 31, 2012

GENERAL LABOR SERVICES

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: RESPONSE TO
MASSACHUSETTS COMMISSION AGAINST DISCRIMINATION COMPLAINT.

POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH POLICE CHIEF RE: DISCIPLINARY ISSUE.

REVIEW VOICE MAIL FROM CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: POLICE
NEGOTIATIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE:
SAME.

SUBTOTAL:	0.40	66.00
TOTAL:	0.40	66.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	66.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 91886

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

APRIL 26, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH March 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

3/6/2012	PAC	WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT - RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO SEWER COMMISSION RE: HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT.	2.90	478.50
3/8/2012	PAC	REVIEW DOCUMENTS INCLUDING TIGHE AND BOND REPORT, CORRESPONDENCE, AND COMMISSION MINUTES AND ANALYZE LEGAL ISSUES TO ADVISE COMMISSION RE: TOWN FARM ROAD SEWER.	3.10	511.50
3/9/2012	PAC	WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT - CONTINUE TO RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER RE: HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS.	5.20	858.00
3/12/2012	PAC	WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT - FINALIZE OPINION LETTER RE: HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS.	0.40	66.00
3/23/2012	PAC	WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT/HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE-CHAIRMAN, SEWER COMMISSION RE: ADDITIONAL QUESTIONS; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM COMMISSION RE: SAME.	0.50	82.50
3/29/2012	PAC	WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT/HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS INC. - ANALYZE FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES TO FURTHER ADVISE COMMISSION RE: AGREEMENT WITH HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS, INC; BEGIN TO DRAFT OPINION TO COMMISSION RE: SAME.	1.90	313.50
			-----	-----
		SUBTOTAL:	14.00	2,310.00

TOTAL: 14.00 2,310.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 0.00

TOTAL DUE: \$ 2,310.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92156

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

MAY 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH April 30, 2012

GENERAL LABOR SERVICES

EVALUATE NEXT STEPS IN ADVISING BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: NEGOTIATIONS.

REVIEW DRUG TESTING POLICIES; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM POLICE CHIEF.

SUBTOTAL:

0.50

82.50

POLICE/CONTRACT NEGOTIATIONS

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: CONTRACT NEGOTIATION STRATEGY.

DRAFT TOWN'S INITIAL PROPOSALS.

REVIEW E-MAIL WITH GROUND RULES AND UNION'S INITIAL PROPOSALS.

PREPARE FOR AND REPRESENT TOWN AT CONTRACT NEGOTIATIONS.

REVIEW CASE LAW RE: PROHIBITION AGAINST SMOKING AFTER EMPLOYMENT.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH UNION ATTORNEY RE: STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS.

DRAFT E-MAIL TO UNION ATTORNEY RE: MEETING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH UNION ATTORNEY RE: SAME.

DRAFT E-MAIL TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN ADVISING THAT BARGAINING SESSION POSTPONED.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH UNION ATTORNEY RE: CANCELLATION OF BARGAINING SESSION.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH UNION ATTORNEY RE: CONTRACT RESOLUTION.

SUBTOTAL:

8.00

1,320.00

TOTAL: 8.50 1,402.50

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 118.50

TOTAL DUE: \$ 1,521.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92237

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

MAY 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH April 30, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

4/9/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED - RESEACH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO COMMISSION RE: ADDITIONAL QUESTIONS.	2.20	363.00
4/10/2012	PAC	FINALIZE OPINION LETTER RE: HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS.	1.30	214.50
4/11/2012	PAC	TOWN FARM ROAD SEWER CONNECTION - ANALYZE FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES.	0.30	49.50
4/13/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE-CHAIRMAN RE: NEXT STEPS IN ADDRESSING ISSUES.	0.10	16.50
4/13/2012	PAC	TOWN FARM ROAD SEWER CONNECTION - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE-CHAIRMAN RE: NEXT STEPS IN ADDRESSING ISSUES.	0.10	16.50
4/30/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM COMMISSION RE: WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT; BEGIN TO DRAFT LETTER TO HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS RE: OBLIGATIONS UNDER AGREEMENT RE: TREATMENT PLANT.	0.20	33.00

SUBTOTAL: 4.20 693.00

TOTAL: 4.20 693.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 0.00

TOTAL DUE: \$ 693.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92238

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

MAY 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH April 30, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

CEMETARY COMMISSION - REVIEW REQUEST FOR ADVICE RE: REFUND ON SALE OF
PLOT; REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: SAME.

SUBTOTAL:	0.20	33.00
TOTAL:	0.20	33.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	33.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92269

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

MAY 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH April 30, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

CSX - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM CHAIRMAN, CONSERVATION COMMISSION RE: CSX GIFT AND TOWN'S OPTIONS; EVALUATE ADVICE TO TOWN RE: SAME.

E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: BUILDING INSPECTOR FEES AND REVOLVING ACCOUNT.

BEMIS ROAD UNREGISTERED VEHICLES - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: REQUEST FOR ADVICE.

CSX - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, CONSERVATION COMMISSION RE: GIFT AND RELATED MATTERS; BEGIN TO DRAFT GIFT AGREEMENT.

CSX - DRAFT GIFT AGREEMENT; REVIEW ETHICS COMMISSION WEBSITE RE: DISCLOSURE REQUIREMENTS.

UNREGISTERED VEHICLES - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: REQUEST FOR ADVICE ON UNREGISTERED VEHICLES.

CSX - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM CHAIRMAN, CONSERVATION COMMISSION RE: GIFT AGREEMENT AND CONFLICT OF INTEREST QUESTIONS; REVISE GIFT AGREEMENT; REVIEW C.268A; DRAFT E-MAIL TO CHAIRMAN RE: REVISED AGREEMENT AND CONFLICT OF INTEREST RESOLUTION; E-MAIL ETHICS COMMISSION FORMS TO CHAIRMAN; REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM CHAIRMAN RE: REVISED AGREEMENT.

NELSON STREET PROJECT - REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: INSURANCE COVERAGE FOR CONTRACTOR.

CSX - REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM CHAIRMAN, CONSERVATION COMMISSION RE: FINALIZING GIFT AGREEMENT, RURAL IMPROVEMENT ASSOCIATION VOTE AND RELATED MATTERS; FINALIZE AGREEMENT AND E-MAIL CHAIRMAN RE: AGREEMENT.

ACCESSIBILITY COMPLAINT - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: FACTS AND REQUEST FOR ADVICE; REVIEW COMPLAINT AND OTHER DOCUMENT FROM COMPLAINANT; ANALYZE FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: ADVICE; RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION (BY E-MAIL) TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: RECOMMENDATIONS FOR RESPONDING TO COMPLAINT.

MOBILE HOME RENT CONTROL BOARD - REVIEW REQUEST FOR LEGAL ADVICE FROM BOARD; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD CHAIRMAN RE: FACTS; REVIEW PRIOR ADVICE TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: RENT ADJUSTMENTS; REVIEW BOARD REGULATIONS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: CONFLICT OF INTEREST ISSUES RE: CSX GRANT AND RELATED MATTERS.

PLANNING BOARD - REVIEW REQUEST FOR ADVICE RE: PROPOSED ZONING BY-LAW AMENDMENTS; BEGIN TO REVIEW AMENDMENTS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, MOBILE HOME RENT CONTROL BOARD RE: RENT INCREASE.

PLANNING BOARD - ZONING BY-LAW AMENDMENTS - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM BOARD AND TOWN PLANNER RE: AMENDMENTS; REPLY TO SAME; BEGIN TO REVIEW AMENDMENTS.

REVIEW WARRANT FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; E-MAIL BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: SAME.

REVIEW PETITIONED ARTICLE; REVIEW DRAFT ZONING BYLAW.

UNREGISTERED VEHICLES - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: REQUEST FOR ASSISTANCE (LEFT MESSAGE).

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: POSSIBLE VIOLATION OF TIF BY WARREN PUMPS AND RELATED MATTERS.

MOBILE HOME RENT CONTROL BOARD - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMAN'S ASSISTANT RE: RENT ADJUSTMENT; REVIEW SAME AND SEND CORRESPONDENCE TO MHR CB CHAIRMAN.

REVIEW ZONING BYLAW AMENDMENTS - MILL CONVERSION OVERLAY DISTRICT AND MAJOR DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CURRENT ZONING BYLAW; DRAFT REVISIONS AND COMMENTS ON BYLAW AMENDMENTS.

CSX - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM TOWN RE: QUESTION ON GIFT AGREEMENT; REPLY TO E-MAIL.

REVIEW WARRANT FOR ANNUAL TOWN MEETING; REVIEW PRIOR YEAR WARRANTS RE: REVOLVING FUND ARTICLE; DRAFT COMMENTS ON WARRANT AND E-MAIL COMMENTS TO SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT RE: QUESTIONS ON REVOLVING FUND ARTICLE; REVIEW REVISED ARTICLE AND E-MAIL ASSISTANT RE: SAME.

CONTINUE TO REVIEW ZONING BY-LAW AMENDMENTS; DRAFT COMMENTS AND REVISIONS RE: SAME; E-MAIL TOWN RE: COMMENTS AND REVISIONS.

REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: QUESTION ON REVOLVING FUND ARTICLE.

E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: PROPOSED TREE TRIMMING BYLAW; REVIEW REPLY.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, MOBILE HOME RENT CONTROL BOARD RE: RENT ADJUSTMENT APPLICATION.

E-MAIL TOWN RE: ADVICE ON OPEN MEETING LAW AND TOWN MEETING (NO CHARGE).

TIF AGREEMENT - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM TOWN; E-MAIL ADVICE TO TOWN RE: ENFORCEMENT OPTIONS.

SUBTOTAL:

18.60

3,019.50

BOH V. EVERGREEN MOBILE HOME PARK

REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE OF COUNSEL FOR COOPERATIVE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR COOPERATIVE RE: STATUS OF MATTER.

REVIEW FILE; EVALUATE NEXT STEPS IN LITIGATION.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR COOPERATIVE RE: STATUS OF MATTER AFTER HEARING BEFORE THE HOUSING COURT.

SUBTOTAL:	1.20	198.00
-----------	------	--------

SOUTH STREET SEWER LINE CERTIFICATION

EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT AND USDA REGIONAL SPECIALIST RE: NEW LOAN FOR SEWER LINE EXTENSION WORK AND REQUIRED DOCUMENTATION.

REQUEST TITLE UPDATE FOR ADDITIONAL LOAN FOR SEWER LINE EXTENSION.

SUBTOTAL:	0.80	132.00
-----------	------	--------

TOTAL:	20.60	3,349.50
--------	-------	----------

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		34.21
--------------	--	-------

TOTAL DUE:	\$	<u>3,383.71</u>
------------	----	-----------------

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92564

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

JUNE 15, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH May 31, 2012

GENERAL LABOR SERVICES

POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH POLICE CHIEF RE: DRUG AND ALCOHOL TESTING; FORWARD E-MAIL WITH POLICY.

RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: NEGOTIATION OF CHARGES TO INSURANCE.

TOWN HALL - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TREASURER RE: EMPLOYEE HEALTH INSURANCE ISSUE.

SUBTOTAL:	0.70	115.50
-----------	------	--------

POLICE/CONTRACT NEGOTIATIONS

COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENT - DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS.

DRAFT E-MAIL TO UNION ATTORNEY REQUESTING STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS; DRAFT E-MAIL TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN ENCLOSED E-MAIL TO UNION.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TREASURER RE: HEALTH INSURANCE ISSUES.

SUBTOTAL:	1.10	181.50
-----------	------	--------

TOTAL:	1.80	297.00
--------	------	--------

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
--------------	--	------

TOTAL DUE:	\$	297.00
-------------------	-----------	---------------

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92567

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

JUNE 15, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH May 31, 2012
GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

5/3/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - DRAFT LETTER FOR SEWER COMMISSION TO SEND TO COMPANY RE: OBLIGATIONS UNDER AGREEMENT; REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE LETTER.	3.30	544.50
5/8/2012	PAC	DRAFT LETTER TO HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS; DRAFT COVER LETTER TO SEWER COMMISSION.	1.10	181.50
5/24/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COMMISSION STAFF RE: DRAFT LETTER TO HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS; E-MAIL LETTER TO WASTE WATER TREATMENT PLANT SUPERINTENDENT.	0.20	33.00
			-----	-----
		SUBTOTAL:	4.60	759.00
		TOTAL:	4.60	759.00
ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.				
		TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
		TOTAL DUE:		-----
			\$	<u>759.00</u>

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92571

WARREN CEMETERY COMMISSION
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

JUNE 15, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH May 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

TITLE TO BURIAL PLOT - REVIEW AND EVALUATE REQUEST FROM BOARD OF CEMETERY COMMISSIONERS FOR OPINION REGARDING TRANSFERRING TITLE TO CEMETERY PLOT BACK TO THE BOARD OF CEMETERY COMMISSIONERS WHEN ORIGINAL DEED IS MISSING.

TITLE TO BURIAL PLOT - LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PROCESS TO TRANSFER TITLE OF BURIAL PLOT; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: RECORDING OF DEEDS OF BURIAL PLOT.

TITLE TO BURIAL PLOT - CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PROCESS TO TRANSFER TITLE OF BURIAL PLOT; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE: RECORDING OF DEEDS OF BURIAL PLOT; DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO CEMETERY COMMISSION RE: RETURN OF BURIAL PLOT TO COMMISSION AND REFUND OF OWNER'S FEE.

TITLE TO BURIAL PLOT - FINALIZE OPINION LETTER TO CEMETERY COMMISSION RE: RETURN OF BURIAL PLOT TO COMMISSION AND REFUND OF OWNER'S FEE.

SUBTOTAL:	4.30	709.50
TOTAL:	4.30	709.50

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	709.50

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92633

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

JUNE 15, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES FROM THROUGH May 31, 2012
GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

REVIEW MOTIONS FOR ANNUAL AND SPECIAL TOWN MEETINGS.

E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: MOTIONS FOR ANNUAL AND SPECIAL TOWN MEETINGS; REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAILS RE: QUANTUM OF VOTE; REVIEW E-MAIL RE: QUESTION ON SECRET BALLOT; REVIEW TOWN BYLAW RE: SECRET BALLOT; E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: SECRET BALLOT.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: PREPARATION FOR TOWN MEETING.

REVIEW REQUEST FOR ADVICE RE: PAYMENT OF FUEL TAX.

REVIEW MOTIONS; E-MAIL SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: MOTIONS; PREPARE FOR AND ADVISE TOWN AT SPECIAL TOWN MEETING AND ANNUAL TOWN MEETING.

REVIEW REQUEST FROM TOWN RE: PILOT AGREEMENT.

FUEL EXCISE TAX - LEGAL RESEARCH TO ADVISE TOWN RE: PAYMENT.

TAXATION - REVIEW PILOT AGREEMENT FOR 261 LITTLE REST ROAD SOLAR SITE AND DRAFT E-MAIL OPINION MEMORANDUM TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: TREATMENT OF ROLL-BACK TAXES UNDER G.L. C. 61A.

MOBILE HOME RENT CONTROL BOARD - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN RE: RENT INCREASE APPLICATION AND BOARD'S OPTIONS.

REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: FUEL EXCISE TAX; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: TAX.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN TREASURER RE: HEALTH CARE INSURANCE; E-MAIL TREASURER RE: ALL TOWN MEMORANDUM; REVIEW REPLY; EVALUATE ADVICE TO TREASURER RE: INSURANCE.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT AND CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: NEXT STEPS IN SCHOOL BORROWING FOLLOWING TOWN MEETING VOTE.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: VOTE ON ANIMAL EXCISE TAX.

CHACE ROAD SOLAR PROJECT - REVIEW FINAL VERSIONS OF PILOT AGREEMENTS.

CSX - REPLY TO QUESTION RE: GIFT AGREEMENT.

FUEL EXCISE - LEGAL RESEARCH TO ADVISE TOWN RE: PAYMENT.

LEGAL RESEARCH TO ADVISE TOWN RE: WHETHER FURTHER TOWN MEETING VOTE IS REQUIRED FOR SCHOOL BORROWING AUTHORITY; E-MAIL TOWN RE: OPINION THAT NO FURTHER VOTE IS REQUIRED.

REVIEW REQUEST FOR ADVICE RE: LANDFILL CONTRACT.

SUBTOTAL:	13.40	2,211.00
-----------	-------	----------

SOUTH STREET SEWER LINE CERTIFICATION

E-MAIL TITLE EXAMINER ORDERING EXPEDITED TITLE UPDATE REPORT.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH USDA REPRESENTATIVE RE: DOCUMENTS RE: NEW LOAN; DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF NO LITIGATION; ATTENTION TO CERTIFICATE RE: STATUS OF CONTRACTS; DRAFT LETTER TO USDA ENCLOSING DOCUMENTS.

SUBTOTAL:	2.30	379.50
-----------	------	--------

TOWN V. WELLER

REVIEW NOTICE FROM COURT ENTERING DEFAULT AGAINST DEFENDANT.

SUBTOTAL:	0.10	16.50
-----------	------	-------

TOTAL: 15.80 2,607.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; TITLE SEARCH, REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 322.00

TOTAL DUE: \$ 2,929.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92698

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

JUNE 25, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH June 15, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WEST WARREN WATER DISTRICT RE: ETHICS QUESTION (NO CHARGE).

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, MOBILE HOME RENT CONTROL BOARD RE: STATUS OF BOARD REVIEW OF RENT AGREEMENT AND RELATED MATTERS.

REVIEW AND REPLY TO VOICE MAIL FROM SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: ROAD WORK.

	-----	-----
SUBTOTAL:	0.50	66.00

BOARD OF HEALTH

TRANSFER STATION - REVIEW BID AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS FOR TRANSFER STATION OPERATION CONTRACT.

	-----	-----
SUBTOTAL:	0.70	115.50

SOUTH STREET SEWER LINE CERTIFICATION

PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR 6/15/12 USDA CLOSING, INCLUDING CERTIFICATE AS TO NO LITIGATION, ATTORNEY'S FEES CERTIFICATE; DRAFT LETTER TO USDA ENCLOSING DOCUMENTS AND REQUESTING ESCROW OF CERTIFICATE AS TO NO LITIGATION.

EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH USDA REPRESENTATIVE RE: CERTIFICATE OF NO LITIGATION, AND RELEASE OF DOCUMENT FROM ESCROW IN CONNECTION WITH CLOSING ON LOAN.

	-----	-----
SUBTOTAL:	2.50	412.50

TOTAL: 3.70 594.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 0.00

TOTAL DUE: \$ 594.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92700

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

JUNE 25, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH June 15, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

6/7/2012	PAC	REVIEW CONTRACT FOR ELECTRIC IMPROVEMENTS TO WASTE WATER TREATMENT PLAN.	0.10	16.50
6/13/2012	PAC	TOWN FARM ROAD - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE CHAIRMAN RE: PREPARATION OF OPINION LETTER.	0.10	16.50
6/13/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE CHAIRMAN RE: CORRESPONDENCE TO COMPANY.	0.10	16.50
6/13/2012	PAC	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE CHAIRMAN RE: ALLOCATION OF DEBT SERVICES COST.	0.10	16.50
6/14/2012	PAC	RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO SEWER COMMISSIONERS RE: TOWN FARM ROAD SEWER EXTENSION.	4.50	742.50
			-----	-----
		SUBTOTAL:	4.90	808.50
		TOTAL:	4.90	808.50
ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.				
		TOTAL COSTS:		0.00

		TOTAL DUE:		\$ 808.50

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92699

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

JUNE 25, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH June 15, 2012

GENERAL LABOR SERVICES

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: TOWN'S OPTIONS RE:
EMPLOYEE DRIVING RECORDS.

	-----	-----
SUBTOTAL:	0.20	33.00

POLICE/CONTRACT NEGOTIATIONS

REVIEW STATUS OF CONTRACT NEGOTIATIONS; DRAFT E-MAIL TO SELECTMEN'S
ASSISTANT ADVISING NO CONTACT FROM UNION.

	-----	-----
SUBTOTAL:	0.20	33.00

TOTAL:	0.40	66.00
--------	------	-------

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00

TOTAL DUE:	\$	<u>66.00</u>
------------	----	--------------

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 92901

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

JUNE 30, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH June 30, 2012
GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

6/21/2012	DJD	PUMP STATION PROJECT - REVIEW OWNER-CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT AND CONTRACTORS BONDS AND INSURANCE CERTIFICATE, AND DRAFT LETTER TO COMMISSION RE: APPROVAL AS TO FORM.	0.70	115.50
6/22/2012	PAC	REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: ELECTRICAL CONTRACT.	0.10	16.50
6/25/2012	PAC	TOWN FARM ROAD - RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION RE: SEWER EXTENSION.	5.00	825.00
6/29/2012	PAC	FINALIZE LETTER RE: TOWN FARM ROAD SEWER EXTENSION.	1.80	297.00
			-----	-----
		SUBTOTAL:	7.60	1,254.00
		TOTAL:	7.60	1,254.00
ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.				
		TOTAL COSTS:		0.00

		TOTAL DUE:	\$	<u>1,254.00</u>

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 93194

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

AUGUST 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH July 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

7/3/2012	PAC	REVIEW REQUEST FOR ADVICE RE: PAYMENT FOR INDIRECT COSTS AND DEBT SERVICE.	0.20	33.00
7/11/2012	PAC	LEGAL RESEARCH TO PREPARE OPINION RE: INDIRECT COSTS AND DEBT SERVICE.	4.00	660.00
7/26/2012	PAC	BEGIN TO RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO BOARD RE: INDIRECT COSTS AND APPROPRIATION FOR DEBT SERVICE.	4.50	742.50
			-----	-----
		SUBTOTAL:	8.70	1,435.50

WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT

7/3/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM COMMISSION AND RESPONSE FROM ATTORNEY FOR HARDWICK RE: WASTE WATER TREATMENT PLANT.	0.10	16.50
7/9/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - REVIEW REPLY FROM ATTORNEY FOR HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS TO COMMISSION'S CORRESPONDENCE; EVALUATE RESPONSE TO REPLY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY FOR HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS RE: COMMISSION'S POSITION AND POSSIBLE RESOLUTION.	0.40	66.00
7/10/2012	PAC	DRAFT LETTER TO SEWER COMMISSION RE: NEXT STEPS IN HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS MATTER.	1.10	181.50
7/16/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - E-MAIL ATTORNEY FOR COMPANY RE: PROPOSED SETTLEMENT; REVIEW REPLY; E-MAIL BOARD RE: REPLY; E-MAIL ATTORNEY RE: NEXT STEPS IN RESOLVING MATTER.	0.50	82.50
7/17/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - DRAFT LETTER TO COMMISSION RE: SETTLEMENT.	0.50	82.50

7/19/2012	PAC	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE-CHAIRMAN RE: HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS RESOLUTION.	0.10	16.50
7/30/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED - ANALYZE NEXT STEPS RE: TERMINATION OF AGREEMENT.	0.60	99.00
			3.30	544.50
		SUBTOTAL:		
		TOTAL:	12.00	1,980.00
ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.				
		TOTAL COSTS:		27.02
		TOTAL DUE:		\$ 2,007.02

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 93253

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

AUGUST 23, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH July 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: SEVERAL PENDING MATTERS.

E-MAIL TOWN RE: ADVICE ON PAYING BILL IN THIS FISCAL YEAR.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: VARIOUS MATTERS (NO CHARGE).

REVIEW E-MAIL FROM BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: REQUEST FOR ADVICE RE: PROCUREMENT PROCEDURES.

SUBTOTAL:

1.10

132.00

BOARD OF HEALTH

TRANSFER STATION - REVIEW BID AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS FOR OPERATION CONTRACT; DRAFT LETTER TO BOARD RE: COMMENTS ON AGREEMENT, APPROVAL AS TO FORM AND CONTRACTOR'S INSURANCE AND BOND REQUIREMENTS; E-MAIL SELECTMAN'S ASSISTANT RE: APPROVAL AS TO FORM.

SUBTOTAL:

0.70

115.50

TOWN V. WELLER

REVIEW NOTICE FROM COURT DISMISSING ACTION; FOLLOW UP RE: SAME.

SUBTOTAL:

0.30

49.50

TOTAL: 2.10 297.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 4.79

TOTAL DUE: \$ 301.79

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 93571

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

SEPTEMBER 24, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH August 31, 2012

GENERAL LABOR SERVICES

POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH POLICE CHIEF RE: INTERNAL
INVESTIGATION MATTER AND POSTING OF PART TIME POSITION.

SUBTOTAL:	0.40	66.00
TOTAL:	0.40	66.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	<u>66.00</u>

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 93611

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

SEPTEMBER 24, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH August 31, 2012
GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

8/3/2012	PAC	ANALYZE FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES AND LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ENTERPRISE FUND ACCOUNTING AND PROPOSED EXPENDITURE OF SEWER ENTERPRISE FUNDS THROUGH INTERFUND TRANSFER FOR DEBT SERVICE; DRAFT LETTER TO SEWER COMMISSIONERS RE: ENTERPRISE FUND ACCOUNTING.	4.80	792.00
8/8/2012	PAC	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE-CHAIRMAN RE: NEXT STEPS IN TERMINATION OF HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT.	0.10	16.50
8/8/2012	PAC	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE-CHAIRMAN RE: PRIVATE PROPERTY CONNECTIONS.	0.10	16.50
8/9/2012	PAC	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TIGHE AND BOND ENGINEER RE: TERMINATION OF HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT.	0.20	33.00
8/24/2012	PAC	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE CHAIRMAN RE: STATUS OF HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT.	0.10	16.50
8/30/2012	JTB	REVIEW REQUEST FOR OPINION RE:SEWER CONNECTING; BEGIN DRAFTING OPINION.	0.90	148.50
8/31/2012	JTB	CONTINUE DRAFTING OPINION LETTER RE: QUESTIONS FROM SEWER COMMISSION; REVIEW TOWN BYLAWS.	1.30	214.50
		SUBTOTAL:	7.50	1,237.50

TOTAL: 7.50 1,237.50

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 0.00

TOTAL DUE: \$ 1,237.50

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 93616

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

SEPTEMBER 24, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH August 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

REVIEW AND REPLY TO QUESTION FROM BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER RE: FY12 BILL (NO CHARGE).

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER RE: REQUEST FOR OPINION RE: MEMBER SERVING AS BOARD OF SELECTMEN ASSISTANT; REVIEW LEGAL ISSUES AND LEGAL RESEARCH TO BEGIN TO PREPARE OPINION.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER RE: REQUEST FOR OPINION RE: ENFORCEMENT OPTIONS RE: BYLAW VIOLATIONS AND NUISANCE ALLEGATIONS - BRIMFIELD ROAD PROPERTY.

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ATTORNEY GENERAL RE: APPROVAL OF ROAD OPENING BYLAW.

REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM TOWN TREASURER RE: LETTER TO SEWER COMMISSION.

RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO SELECTMAN RE: APPOINTMENT OF MEMBER OF BOARD OF SELECTMEN TO POSITION SUPERVISED BY BOARD.

RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: ENFORCEMENT OPTIONS - BRIMFIELD ROAD PROPERTY.

REVIEW ATTORNEY GENERAL'S APPROVAL LETTER RE: MILL CONVERSION OVERLAY DISTRICT ZONING BY-LAW AMENDMENT; REVIEW AMENDMENT; CONFIRM RECEIPT OF ATTORNEY GENERAL APPROVAL WITH ATTORNEY GENERAL.

RENT CONTROL BOARD - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, RENT CONTROL BOARD RE: RENT ADJUSTMENT PROCEEDINGS AND BOARD'S PREPARATION OF DECISION.

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM RENT CONTROL BOARD RE: TENANT'S POSITION RE: RENT ADJUSTMENT APPLICATION.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER RE: OPEN MEETING LAW QUESTION AND INITIAL INTERVIEWS; DRAFT OPINION LETTER (BY E-MAIL) TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: SAME.

REVIEW RENT CONTROL BYLAW; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RENT CONTROL BOARD CHAIRMAN RE: BYLAW INTERPRETATION AND PREPARATION OF BOARD DECISION ON TENANT RENT DECREASE PETITION.

REVIEW REQUEST FOR REVIEW OF EASEMENT FROM PLANNING BOARD FOR SOLAR PROJECT; EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH PLANNING BOARD ASSISTANT RE: REVIEW.

SOLAR PROJECT EASEMENT - ANALYZE PROPOSED EASEMENT DEED FOR FIRE SUPPRESSION EQUIPMENT; RESEARCH ISSUE OF NECESSITY FOR TOWN MEETING VOTE TO ACCEPT EASEMENT.

SUBTOTAL:	8.80	1,419.00
TOTAL:	8.80	1,419.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		22.02
TOTAL DUE:	\$	<u>1,441.02</u>

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 93902

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

OCTOBER 22, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH September 30, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

SOLAR EASEMENT - REVIEW EASEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PLANNING BOARD STAFF RE: EASEMENT AND TOWN MEETING VOTE.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STAFF TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: DOG COMPLAINT ADVICE; REVIEW FILE TO ADVISE BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: SAME.

FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT - CONTINUE RESEARCH RE: NECESSITY FOR TOWN MEETING VOTE; REVISE PROPOSED GRANT OF EASEMENT IN FAVOR OF TOWN; E-MAIL TOWN TRANSMITTING DOCUMENT AND ADVISING OF NEED FOR TOWN MEETING VOTE.

REVIEW E-MAIL RE: CONSERVATION RESTRICTION FOR SOLAR PROJECT.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMAN SOUZA RE: UPCOMING SPECIAL TOWN MEETING, VERIZON CASE AND OTHER MATTERS; FOLLOW-UP RE: SAME.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: QUESTIONS ON KENNEL LICENSING AND DOG INCIDENT; REVIEW RECENTLY AMENDED DOG STATUTES.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: PROCEDURES FOR ELECTING TEMPORARY MODERATOR.

REVIEW WARRANT FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING.

KENNEL LICENSE - RESEARCH AND REVIEW VARIOUS CASES RE: VALIDITY MUNICIPAL LICENSE MORATORIA AND GENERAL ABILITY OF TOWN TO RESTRICT ISSUANCE OF LICENSE.

E-MAIL TOWN RE: COVERAGE FOR TOWN MEETING ON 11/8/12.

RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: KENNEL MORATORIUM PROPOSAL.

TOWN MEETING - REVIEW ENGINEERING CONTRACT BETWEEN TOWN AND LENARD ENGINEERING.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, RENT CONTROL BOARD RE: PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.

SUBTOTAL:

10.90

1,798.50

APPELLATE TAX BOARD

REVIEW REQUEST FOR ADVICE RE: VERIZON TAX ABATEMENT.

VERIZON - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER RE:
PROPOSED SETTLEMENT.

VERIZON - REVIEW LETTER FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL AND FAX FROM
ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT RE: SETTLEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT.

	0.70	115.50
--	------	--------

DOWNTOWN (MAIN STREET) IMPROVEMENTS

REVIEW PLANS FOR MODIFICATIONS TO MAIN STREET; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH ENGINEERS RE: EASEMENTS TO BE TAKEN.

DRAFT WARRANT ARTICLE AND ANALYZE ISSUES RE: TAKING/GRANT OF
INTERESTS IN MAIN STREET PROJECT.

ANALYZE NEED FOR ALTERATION OF ROAD; DRAFT WARRANT ARTICLE TO
TRANSFER CUSTODY OF PROPERTY FROM BOARD OF SELECTMEN FOR PURPOSE OF
PUBLIC WAY, ALTERATION OF MAIN STREET AND APPROPRIATION OF FUNDS TO
PAY FOR ANY TAKINGS.

CONTINUE TO DRAFT WARRANT ARTICLE; E-MAIL BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE:
WARRANT ARTICLE, INCLUDING NEED TO TRANSFER PROPERTY FOR PURPOSE OF
PUBLIC WAY, ALTERING ROAD AND APPROPRIATION OF FUNDS FOR TAKINGS IF
WAIVERS OF DAMAGES AND APPRAISAL NOT RECEIVED.

	4.10	676.50
--	------	--------

TOTAL:	15.70	2,590.50
--------	-------	----------

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		17.71
--------------	--	-------

TOTAL DUE:	\$	2,608.21
------------	----	----------

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 93903

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

OCTOBER 22, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH September 30, 2012
GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

9/4/2012	JTB	REVIEW SPECIAL ACT CREATING SEWER COMMISSION AND RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE SEWER COMMISSION TO ANALYZE ISSUES AND PREPARE TO ANSWER NUMEROUS QUESTIONS OF THE SEWER COMMISSION.	1.20	198.00
9/10/2012	PAC	LEAVE DETAILED VOICEMAIL MESSAGE FOR TIGHE AND BOND ENGINEER RE: HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT.	0.10	16.50
9/13/2012	PAC	HARWICK KNITTED FABRICS- REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM ATTORNEY FOR HARWICK KNITTED FABRICS RE: STATUS OF AGREEMENT; E-MAIL TOWN REGARDING THE SAME.	0.30	49.50
9/18/2012	JTB	RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER RE: QUESTIONS FROM THE SEWER COMMISSION RE: UNLAWFUL CONNECTIONS AND RELATED MATTERS.	2.50	412.50
9/26/2012	PAC	REVIEW VOICE MAIL MESSAGE FROM TIGHE AND BOND ENGINEER RE: HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT; E-MAIL AGREEMENT TO ENGINEER.	0.10	16.50
9/28/2012	PAC	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH VICE CHAIRMAN, SEWER COMMISSION RE: STATUS OF HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT AND OPINION LETTER RE: SEWER CONNECTIONS.	0.20	33.00
		SUBTOTAL:	4.40	726.00

TOTAL: 4.40 726.00

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 0.00

TOTAL DUE: \$ 726.00

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 94209

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

NOVEMBER 21, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH October 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

10/1/2012	JTB	FINALIZE OPINION LETTER AND SEND TO COMMISSION.	1.00	165.00
10/3/2012	PAC	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: TERMINATION OF HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT.	0.10	16.50
10/4/2012	PAC	E-MAIL ATTORNEY FOR HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION POSITION ON TERMINATION OF AGREEMENT; E-MAIL TOWN ENGINEER RE: SAME.	0.30	49.50
10/16/2012	PAC	DRAFT TERMINATION OF HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT.	1.20	198.00
10/17/2012	PAC	FINALIZE DRAFT OF HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS TERMINATION AGREEMENT; E-MAIL ATTORNEY FOR COMPANY RE: DRAFT; REVIEW REPLY; PREPARE NEXT STEPS IN NEGOTIATING AGREEMENT.	0.90	148.50
10/24/2012	PAC	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COMMISSION VICE-CHAIRMAN RE: HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS AGREEMENT.	0.10	16.50
			-----	-----
		SUBTOTAL:	3.60	594.00
		TOTAL:	3.60	594.00
		ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.		
		TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
		TOTAL DUE:		<u>\$ 594.00</u>

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617)556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 94223

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

NOVEMBER 21, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH October 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: KENNEL
LICENSE MORATORIUM.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD OF SELECTMEN STAFF RE: UPCOMING
SPECIAL TOWN MEETING, WARRANT PREPARATION AND RELATED MATTERS.

REVIEW AND REPLY E-MAIL FROM BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: APPOINTMENT OF
TEMPORARY MODERATOR.

FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT - ANALYZE COUNTERPROPOSAL OF ATTORNEY FOR
PROPERTY OWNER RE: EASEMENT FOR DRY HYDRANT.

FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT - E-MAIL TOWN PLANNER RE: MODIFICATIONS TO
EASEMENT DEED.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE:
PREPARATION FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING WARRANTS AND RELATED
MATTERS.

DRAFT WARRANT ARTICLE FOR FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT.

REVIEW DRAFT WARRANT FOR 11/8/12 SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: WARRANT; BEGIN
TO PREPARE COMMENTS ON WARRANT.

E-MAIL ASSISTANT TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: WARRANT FOR 11/08/2012
TOWN MEETING.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE:
WARRANT FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; FOLLOW UP RE: FIRE SUPPRESSION
EASEMENT ARTICLE AND PREPARATION OF PLAN SHOWING EASEMENT.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE:
WARRANT FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; REVIEW FINAL DRAFT WARRANT;
E-MAIL BOARD SELECTMEN RE: WARRANT.

FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT TO
PLANNING BOARD RE: EASEMENT, AND GENERATION OF PLAN; REVIEW PLAN
(GOOGLE MAPS) PREPARED BY TOWN; TRANSMIT TO DEVELOPER'S COUNSEL FOR
REVIEW.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE:
REQUIREMENTS FOR PUBLISHING NOTICE OF SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; REVIEW
STATE LAW AND TOWN BYLAWS RE: NOTICE REQUIREMENTS; FOLLOW UP
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT RE: ADVICE ON PUBLISHING.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: POLICE
ISSUE; RESEARCH FACTS; ANALYZE FACTS AND ISSUES TO ADVISE BOARD OF

SELECTMEN RE: OPTIONS IN HANDLING MATTER.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH POLICE CHIEF RE: RECENT INCIDENT REPORTED IN NEWSPAPER.

EXCHANGE VOICEMAILS WITH CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: POLICE DEPARTMENT.

	10.60	1,749.00
--	-------	----------

DOWNTOWN (MAIN STREET) IMPROVEMENTS

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PROJECT MANAGER RE: WAIVERS FROM PRIVATE PROPERTY OWNERS AND DAMAGES AWARDS.

DRAFT SURPLUS VOTE, VOTE ON LAYOUT ON MAIN STREET AND SOUTHBRIDGE ROAD ALTERATION WITH RECOMMENDATION TO PLANNING BOARD; DRAFT WAIVERS FOR PROPERTY OWNERS; DRAFT/REVISE WARRANT ARTICLE.

CONTINUE TO DRAFT DOCUMENTS RELATIVE TO DOWNTOWN STREET ALTERATION AND IMPROVEMENTS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT TO PLANNING BOARD RE: VOTES OF BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: ROAD ALTERATION.

	4.40	726.00
--	------	--------

TOTAL:	15.00	2,475.00
--------	-------	----------

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		8.81
--------------	--	------

TOTAL DUE:	\$	2,483.81
------------	----	----------

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 94570

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

DECEMBER 19, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH November 30, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRMAN, BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: TOWN MEETING CONSIDERATION OF QUESTION ON STRAW VOTE AND RELATED MATTERS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMAN SOUZA RE: ARTICLE 1 ON TOWN MEETING WARRANT; REVIEW ARTICLE; REVIEW STATUS OF WAIVER FROM PROPERTY OWNERS; EVALUATE ADVICE TO TOWN RE: MOTION UNDER ARTICLE.

REVIEW FACTS AND ISSUES RE: ARTICLE 19 ON WARRANT FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; REVIEW PLAN; REVIEW E-MAILS FROM PROPERTY OWNER RE: EASEMENT.

FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PLANNING DIRECTOR RE: PROPOSED PLAN FOR EASEMENT DEED; ANALYZE AERIAL PHOTOGRAPH OF EASEMENT AREA.

PREPARE MOTIONS UNDER ARTICLES 1 AND 19 FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; PREPARE FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING.

PREPARE FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; MEET WITH BOARD OF SELECTMEN PRIOR TO MEETING; ADVISE TOWN AT MEETING (NO CHARGE).

FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT - REVISE WARRANT ARTICLE RE: FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT.

FOLLOW-UP FROM TOWN MEETING.

QRSD- REVIEW E-MAIL FROM SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: DISTRICT BORROWING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: FACTS; REVIEW DISTRICT VOTE AND DISTRICT AGREEMENT; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PROCEDURE FOR TOWN TO DISAPPROVE DISTRICT BORROWING; DRAFT OPINION LETTER BY E-MAIL TO BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: SAME.

QRSD- REVIEW E-MAIL FROM SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: SPECIAL TOWN MEETING AND RELATED MATTERS.

QRSD- REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM SELECTMEN'S ASSISTANT RE: WARRANT ARTICLE; BEGIN TO DRAFT ARTICLE.

SUBTOTAL:

13.60

990.00

DOWNTOWN (MAIN STREET) IMPROVEMENTS

ANALYZE ISSUES RE: ROAD IMPROVEMENTS; WAIVERS FROM PROPERTY OWNERS; E-MAIL RE: NEED FOR WAIVERS OR NEED TO APPROPRIATE MONIES AND OBTAIN

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 94571

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

DECEMBER 19, 2012

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH November 30, 2012

GENERAL LABOR SERVICES

POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH POLICE CHIEF RE: PENDING COMPLAINT.

POLICE - REVIEW FAX FROM POLICE CHIEF RE: CITIZEN COMPLAINT; DRAFT
RESPONSE TO CITIZEN DISMISSING COMPLAINT; E-MAIL BOARD OF SELECTMEN
RE: RESPONSE.

SUBTOTAL:	0.70	115.50
TOTAL:	0.70	115.50

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL
POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:		0.00
TOTAL DUE:	\$	<u>115.50</u>

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 94848

BOARD OF SELECTMEN
WARREN TOWN HALL
48 HIGH STREET
WARREN, MA 01083

JANUARY 28, 2013

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH December 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

QRSD - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM SELECTMAN'S ASSISTANT RE: NOTICE FROM SCHOOL DISTRICT.

REVIEW E-MAIL REQUEST FOR ADVICE RE: HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT AND DISPOSITION OF TOWN EQUIPMENT.

FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT - REVISE EASEMENT DEED, EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH ATTORNEY FOR DEVELOPER OF PROPERTY RE: STATUS OF EASEMENT DEED AND PROPOSED CHANGES AND TIMING OF CONVEYANCE.

REVIEW E-MAILS RE: FINALIZING FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT.

FIRE SUPPRESSION EASEMENT - ANALYZE RESPONSE OF ATTORNEY FOR DEVELOPER RE: STATUS OF EASEMENT AND CONVEYANCE THEREOF.

QRSD- DRAFT WARRANT ARTICLE AND E-MAIL SELECTMAN'S ASSISTANT RE: ARTICLE.

HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT- DRAFT AGREEMENT; REVIEW C.30B PROPERTY DISPOSITION REQUIREMENTS; E-MAIL SELECTMAN'S ASSISTANT RE: AGREEMENT AND DISPOSITION REQUIREMENTS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER RE: CONFLICT OF INTEREST QUESTION; LEGAL RESEARCH TO ADVISE MEMBER.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PLANNING BOARD ASSISTANT RE: NOTICE REQUIREMENTS FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING.

REVIEW DRAFT WARRANT FOR SPECIAL TOWN MEETING ON 1/5/13; E-MAIL SELECTMAN'S ASSISTANT RE: APPROVAL AS TO FORM WITH MINOR REVISIONS.

SUBTOTAL:

3.90

643.50

DOWNTOWN (MAIN STREET) IMPROVEMENTS

EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH PROJECT ENGINEER RE: STATUS OF WAIVERS FROM PROPERTY OWNERS AND TIMING OF TAKINGS.

SUBTOTAL:

0.40

66.00

TOTAL: 4.30 709.50

ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS: 0.00

TOTAL DUE: \$ 709.50

KOPELMAN AND PAIGE, P.C.

101 ARCH STREET
BOSTON, MA 02110
(617) 556-0007

STATEMENT NO. 94881

WARREN SEWER COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1537
WARREN MA 01083

JANUARY 28, 2013

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH December 31, 2012

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

12/6/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS- E-MAIL ATTORNEY FOR COMPANY RE: SETTLEMENT; LEGAL RESEARCH INDEMNIFICATION UNDER COMMON LAW.	0.50	82.50
12/7/2012	PAC	E-MAIL ATTORNEY FOR HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS RE: INDEMNIFICATION PROVISION IN AGREEMENT.	0.20	33.00
12/18/2012	PAC	HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS - DRAFT LETTER TO COMMISSION RE: STATUS OF AGREEMENT ON USE OF WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT.	0.40	66.00
12/19/2012	PAC	FINALIZE LETTER TO COMMISSION RE: HARDWICK KNITTED FABRICS.	0.10	16.50
			-----	-----
		SUBTOTAL:	1.20	198.00
		TOTAL:	1.20	198.00
		ACCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.		
		TOTAL COSTS:		0.00

		TOTAL DUE:	\$	<u>198.00</u>